O o0 N N B W =

[\ T NG T NG T N I N e T o T e T e T e S = S = S =Y
W NN = O O 0 9 N B WD = O

24
25

2176
apply with respect to the performance or coverage of abor-
tions.”.

(4) The bill referred to wn subsection (a) s
amended by striking section 201.

Subtitle C—Provisions Relating to
Title III
SEC. 10301. PLANS FOR A VALUE-BASED PURCHASING PRO-
GRAM FOR AMBULATORY SURGICAL CEN-
TERS.
(a) IN GENERAL.—RSection 3006 is amended by adding
at the end the following new subsection:
“(f) AMBULATORY SURGICAL CENTERS.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall develop
a plan to implement a value-based purchasing pro-
gram for payments under the Medicare program
under title XVIII of the Social Security Act for am-
bulatory surgical centers (as described in  section
1833(1) of the Social Security Act (42 U.S.C.
13951(i))).

“(2) DErAILS.—In developing the plan under
paragraph (1), the Secretary shall consider the fol-
lowing 1ssues:

“tA) The ongoing development, selection,
and modification process for measures (including

under section 1890 of the Social Security Act (42

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 3 O WD b W N e

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG R NS B S e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO S e

2177
U.S.C. 1395aaa) and section 1890A of such Act,

as added by section 3014), to the extent feasible
and practicable, of all dimensions of quality and
efficiency in ambulatory surgical centers.

“(B) The reporting, collection, and valida-
tion of quality data.

“(C) The structure of value-based payment
adjustments, including the determination of
thresholds or amprovements in quality that
would substantiate a payment adjustment, the
size of such payments, and the sources of funding
Jor the value-based bonus payments.

“(D) Methods for the public disclosure of in-
Jormation on the performance of ambulatory sur-
gical centers.

“(E) Any other issues determined appro-
priate by the Secretary.

“(3) CONSULTATION.—In developing the plan

under paragraph (1), the Secretary shall—

“(A) consult with relevant affected parties;
and

“(B) consider experience with such dem-
onstrations that the Secretary determines are rel-
evant to the value-based purchasing program de-

seribed in paragraph (1).

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O o0 N N D Bk W

[\ I \© R \O R O R N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0 N RN = O

2178

“(4) REPORT TO CONGRESS.—Not later than
January 1, 2011, the Secretary shall submit to Con-
gress a report containing the plan developed under
paragraph (1).”.

(b) TECIHNICAL.—Section 3006(a)(2)(A) is amended
by striking clauses (1) and (11).

SEC. 10302. REVISION TO NATIONAL STRATEGY FOR QUAL-
ITY IMPROVEMENT IN HEALTH CARE.

Section 399HH(a)(2)(B)(ini) of the Public Health
Service Act, as added by section 3011, is amended by insert-
g “(taking into consideration the limitations set forth in
subsections (c) and (d) of section 1182 of the Social Security
Act)” after “information”.

SEC. 10303. DEVELOPMENT OF OUTCOME MEASURES.

(a) DEVELOPMENT.—Section 931 of the Public Health
Service Act, as added by section 3013(a), s amended by
adding at the end the following new subsection:

“(f) DEVELOPMENT OF OUTCOME MEASURES.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall develop,
and periodically update (not less than every 3 years),
provider-level outcome measures for hospitals and
physicians, as well as other providers as determined

appropriate by the Secretary.

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O o0 9 N U B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

2179

“(2) CATEGORIES OF MEASURES.—The measures
developed under this subsection shall include, to the
extent determined appropriate by the Secretary—

“(A) outcome measurement for acute and
chronic diseases, including, to the extent feasible,
the 5 most prevalent and resource-intensive acute
and chronic medical conditions; and

“(B) outcome measurement for primary and
preventative care, including, to the extent fea-
sible, measurements that cover provision of such
care for distinct patient populations (such as
healthy children, chronically ill adults, or infirm
elderly individuals).

“(3) GoaLs.—In developing such measures, the
Secretary shall seek to—

“(A) address issues regarding risk adjust-
ment, accountability, and sample size;

“(B) include the full scope of services that
comprise a cycle of care; and

“(C) wclude multiple dimensions.

“(4) TIMEFRAME.—

“(A) ACUTE AND CHRONIC DISEASES.—Not
later than 24 months after the date of enactment
of this Act, the Secretary shall develop not less

than 10 measures described in paragraph (2)(A).

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 2 O WD B W N

O TN NG I N T NG I NG I NS B e e T e e T e T e e T
L A W NN = DO VO XN R WD = O

2180
“(B) PRIMARY AND PREVENTIVE CARE.—
Not later than 36 months after the date of enact-
ment of this Act, the Secretary shall develop not
less than 10 measures described in paragraph
(2)(B).”.

(b)  HOSPITAL-ACQUIRED  CONDITIONS.—Section
1890A of the Social Security Act, as amended by section
3013(b), is amended by adding at the end the following new
subsection:

“(f) HosprrtaL AcQUIRED CONDITIONS.—The Sec-
retary shall, to the extent practicable, publicly report on
measures for hospital-acquired conditions that are currently

utilized by the Centers for Medicare & Medicard Services

Jor the adjustment of the amount of payment to hospitals

based on rates of hospital-acquired infections.”.

(¢) OLINICAL PRACTICE GUIDELINES.—Section 304(b)
of the Medicare Improvements for Patients and Providers
Act of 2008 (Public Law 110-275) is amended by adding
at the end the following new paragraph:

“(4) IDENTIFICATION.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Following receipt of the
report submitted under paragraph (2), and not
less than every 3 years thereafter, the Secretary
shall contract with the Institute to employ the

results of the study performed wunder paragraph

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O o0 N N B W =

e T S N e N T T e T = T =
O o0 N O »n B~ W N = O

20
21
22
23
24
25

2181
(1) and the best methods identified by the Insti-

tute for the purpose of identifying existing and

new clinical practice guidelines that were devel-

oped using such best methods, including guide-
lines listed in the National Guideline Clearing-
house.

“(B) CONSULTATION.—In carrying out the

vdentification process under subparagraph (A),

the Secretary shall allow for consultation with

professional societies, voluntary health care orga-
nizations, and expert panels.”.
SEC. 10304. SELECTION OF EFFICIENCY MEASURES.
Sections 1890(b)(7) and 1890A of the Social Security
Act, as added by section 3014, are amended by striking
“quality” each place it appears and inserting “quality and
efficiency”.
SEC. 10305. DATA COLLECTION; PUBLIC REPORTING.
Section 39911(a) of the Public Health Service Act, as
added by section 3015, 1s amended to read as follows:
“(a) IN GENERAL.—

“(1) KSTABLISHMENT OF STRATEGIC FRAME-
WORK.—The Secretary shall establish and implement
an overall strategic framework to carry out the public
reporting of performance information, as described in

section 399JJ. Such strategic framework may include

HR 3590 EAS/PP



2182

1 methods and related timelines for implementing na-
2 tionally consistent data collection, data aggregation,
3 and analysis methods.

4 “(2) COLLECTION AND AGGREGATION OF DATA.—
5 The Secretary shall collect and aggregate consistent
6 data on quality and resource use measures from in-
7 Jormation systems used to support health care deliv-
8 ery, and may award grants or contracts for this pur-
9 pose. The Secretary shall align such collection and ag-
10 gregation efforts with the requirements and assistance
11 regarding the expansion of health information tech-
12 nology systems, the interoperability of such technology
13 systems, and related standards that are in effect on
14 the date of enactment of the Patient Protection and
15 Affordable Care Act.

16 “(3) ScorE.—The Secretary shall ensure that
17 the data collection, data aggregation, and analysis
18 systems described in paragraph (1) involve an in-
19 creasingly broad range of patient populations, pro-
20 viders, and geographic areas over time.” .
21 SEC. 10306. IMPROVEMENTS UNDER THE CENTER FOR
22 MEDICARE AND MEDICAID INNOVATION.
23 Section 1115A of the Social Security Act, as added by

24 section 3021, is amended—

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 3 O WD A W N -

[\ I NS R T e e T e T e T e T e T e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ W NN = O

22
23
24
25

2183
(1) in subsection (a), by inserting at the end the

Jollowing new paragraph:

“(5) TESTING WITHIN CERTAIN GEOGRAPHIC
AREAS.—For purposes of testing payment and service
delivery models under this section, the Secretary may
elect to limit testing of a model to certain geographic
areas.”’;

(2) wn subsection (b)(2)—

(A) in subparagraph (A)—

(i) i the second sentence, by striking
“the preceding sentence may include” and
mserting “this subparagraph may include,
but are not limited to,”; and

(11) by inserting after the first sentence
the following new sentence: “The Secretary
shall focus on models expected to reduce pro-
gram costs under the applicable title whaile
preserving or enhancing the quality of care
recewved by individuals recewving benefits
under such title.”;
(B) in subparagraph (B), by adding at the

end the following new clauses:

“(xix) Utilizing, in particular in enti-

ties located wn medically underserved areas

and facilities of the Indian Health Service

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 3 O WD b W N e

|\ I O R NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e T e e e T
AW N = O 0O 0NN N B WNDd = O

2184

(whether operated by such Service or by an
Indian tribe or tribal organization (as those
terms ave defined in section 4 of the Indian
Health Care Improvement Act)), telehealth
services—

“(1) in treating behavioral health
issues  (such as post-traumatic stress
disorder) and stroke; and

“(II) to improve the capacity of
non-medical providers and non-special-
1zed  medical providers to provide
health services for patients with chron-
1c complex conditions.

“(xx) Utilizing a diverse network of
providers of services and suppliers to im-
prove care coordination for applicable indi-
viduals described in subsection (a)(4)(A)(1)
with 2 or more chronic conditions and a
history — of  prior-year  hospitalization
through wnterventions developed under the
Medicare Coordinated Care Demonstration
Project under section 4016 of the Balanced
Budget Act of 1997 (42 U.S.C. 1395b—1

note).”; and

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 3 O WD b W N

[\© TN O T N T NG I NS R N B e e T e e T e T e T Y =
[ B N U N N = = NN - BN B e ) W ) LR ~S O I NO R e

2185

(C) in subparagraph (C), by adding at the
end the following new clause:

“(viir) Whether the model demonstrates
effective linkage with other public sector or
private sector payers.”;

(3) wn subsection (b)(4), by adding at the end the
Jollowing new subparagraph:

“(C) MEASURE SELECTION.—To the extent
Sfeasible, the Secretary shall select measures under
this paragraph that reflect national priorities for
quality vmprovement and patient-centered care
consistent with the measures described in
1890(b)(7)(B).”; and
(4) in subsection (c)—

(A) wn paragraph (1)(B), by striking “care
and reduce spending; and” and inserting “pa-
tient care without increasing spending;”;

(B) in paragraph (2), by striking “reduce
program spending under applicable titles.” and
mserting “reduce (or would not result in any in-
crease in) net program spending under applica-
ble titles; and”; and

(C) by adding at the end the following:

“(3) the Secretary determines that such expan-

ston would not deny or limit the coverage or provi-

HR 3590 EAS/PP



[E—

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

2186
swon of benefits under the applicable title for applica-
ble individuals.
In determining which models or demonstration projects to

expand under the preceding sentence, the Secretary shall

Jocus on models and demonstration projects that 1mprove

the quality of patient care and reduce spending.”.
SEC. 10307. IMPROVEMENTS TO THE MEDICARE SHARED
SAVINGS PROGRAM.

Section 1899 of the Social Security Act, as added by
section 3022, 1s amended by adding at the end the following
new subsections:

“(v) OrrION TO USE OTHER PAYMENT MODELS.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—If the Secretary determines
appropriate, the Secretary may use any of the pay-
ment models described wn paragraph (2) or (3) for
making payments under the program rather than the

payment model described in subsection (d).

“(2) PARTIAL CAPITATION MODEL.—

“(A) IN GENERAL—Subject to subpara-
graph (B), a model described in this paragraph
15 a partial capitation model in which an ACO
18 at financial risk for some, but not all, of the
items and services covered under parts A and B,
such as at risk for some or all physicians’ serv-

1ces or all items and services under part B. The

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 3 O WD B W N e

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

2187

Secretary may limit a partial capitation model
to ACOs that are highly integrated systems of
care and to ACOs capable of bearing risk, as de-
termined to be appropriate by the Secretary.

“(B) NO ADDITIONAL PROGRAM EXPENDI-
TURES.—Payments to an ACO for items and
services under this title for beneficiaries for a
year under the partial capitation model shall e
established in a manner that does not result in

spending more for such ACO for such bene-

Jfictaries than would otherwise be expended for

such ACO for such beneficiaries for such year if
the model were not implemented, as estimated by
the Secretary.

“(3) OTHER PAYMENT MODELS.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Subject to subpara-
graph (B), a model described in this paragraph
15 any payment model that the Secretary deter-
manes will improve the quality and efficiency of
ttems and services furnished under thas title.

“(B) NO ADDITIONAL PROGRAM EXPENDI-
TURES.—Subparagraph (B) of paragraph (2)
shall apply to a payment model under subpara-

graph (A) in a similar manner as such subpara-

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 3 O WD A W N e

O TN NG I N T NS I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
[ B N O N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO R e

2188
graph (B) applies to the payment model under

paragraph (2).

“()) INVOLVEMENT IN PRIVATE PAYER AND OTHER
THIRD PARTY ARRANGEMENTS.—The Secretary may give
preference to ACOs who are participating in similar ar-
rangements with other payers.

“(k) TREATMENT OF PHYSICIAN (GROUP PRACTICE
DEMONSTRATION.—During the period beginning on the
date of the enactment of this section and ending on the date
the program 1s established, the Secretary may enter into
an agreement with an ACO under the demonstration under
section 18664, subject to rebasing and other modifications
deemed appropriate by the Secretary.”.

SEC. 10308. REVISIONS TO NATIONAL PILOT PROGRAM ON
PAYMENT BUNDLING.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 1866D of the Social Secu-
rity Act, as added by section 3023, is amended—

(1) wn paragraph (a)(2)(B), in the matter pre-
ceding clause (v), by striking “S conditions” and in-
serting “10 conditions”;

(2) by striking subsection (¢)(1)(B) and inserting
the following:

“(B) EXPANSION.—The Secretary may, at
any point after January 1, 2016, expand the du-

ration and scope of the pilot program, to the ex-

HR 3590 EAS/PP



2189

1 tent determaned appropriate by the Secretary,
2 if—

3 “(1) the Secretary determines that such
4 expansion is expected to—

5 “(I) reduce spending under title
6 XVIII of the Social Security Act with-
7 out reducing the quality of care; or

8 “(1I) improve the quality of care
9 and reduce spending;

10 “(11) the Chief Actuary of the Centers
11 for Medicare & Medicaid Services certifies
12 that such expansion would reduce program
13 spending under such title XVIII; and

14 “(iir) the Secretary determines that
15 such expansion would not deny or limit the
16 coverage or provision of benefits under this
17 title for individuals.”; and

18 (3) by striking subsection (g) and inserting the
19 Jollowing new subsection:
20 “lg) APPLICATION OF PILor PrOGrAM TO CON-

21 TINUING COARE HOSPITALS.—

22 “(1) IN GENERAL.—In conducting the pilot pro-
23 gram, the Secretary shall apply the provisions of the
24 program so as to separately pilot test the continuing
25 care hospital model.

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O o0 9 N U B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

2190

“(2) SPECIAL RULES.—In pilot testing the con-
tinuing care hospital model under paragraph (1), the
Jollowing rules shall apply:

“(A) Such model shall be tested without the
limitation to the conditions selected under sub-
section (a)(2)(B).

“(B) Notwithstanding subsection (a)(2)(D),
an episode of care shall be defined as the full pe-
riod that a patient stays in the continuing care
hospital plus the first 30 days following dis-
charge from such hospital.

“(3) CONTINUING CARE HOSPITAL DEFINED.—In
this subsection, the term ‘continuing care hospital’
means an entity that has demonstrated the ability to
meet patient care and patient safety standards and
that provides under common management the medical
and rehabilitation services provided in inpatient re-
habilitation hospitals and units (as defined in section
1886(d)(1)(B)(1v)), long term care hospitals (as de-
fined in section 1886(d)(1)(B)(w)(I)), and skilled
nursing facilities (as defined in section 1819(a)) that
are located in a hospital described n  section
1886(d).”.

(b) TECHNICAL AMENDMENTS.—

HR 3590 EAS/PP



2191

(1) Section 3023 s amended by striking
“1886C” and inserting “1866C".

(2) Title XVIII of the Social Security Act s
amended by redesignating section 1866D, as added by
section 3024, as section 1866L.

SEC. 10309. REVISIONS TO HOSPITAL READMISSIONS RE-
DUCTION PROGRAM.
Section 1886(q)(1) of the Social Security Act, as added
by section 3025, in the matter preceding subparagraph (A),
1s amended by striking “the Secretary shall reduce the pay-
ments” and all that follows through “the product of” and
wmserting “the Secretary shall make payments (in addition
to the payments described in paragraph (2)(4)(11)) for such
a discharge to such hospital under subsection (d) (or section
1814(b)(3), as the case may be) in an amount equal to the
product of”’.
SEC. 10310. REPEAL OF PHYSICIAN PAYMENT UPDATE.
The provisions of, and the amendment made by, sec-
tion 3101 are repealed.
SEC. 10311. REVISIONS TO EXTENSION OF AMBULANCE
ADD-ONS.
(a) GROUND AMBULANCE.—Section 1834(1)(13)(4) of
the Social Security Act (42 U.S.C. 1395m(l)(13)(A)), as
amended by section 3105(a), is further amended—

(1) wn the matter preceding clause (1)—

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 3 O WD b W N e

p—
- O

12
13
14

2192
(A4) by striking “2007, for” and inserting
“2007, and for”; and
(B) by striking “2010, and for such services
Jurnished on or after April 1, 2010, and before
January 1, 20117 and inserting “20117’; and
(2) wn each of clauses (1) and (11)—
(A4) by striking “, and on or after April 1,
2010, and before January 1, 20117 each place it
appears; and
(B) by striking “January 1, 2010” and in-
serting “January 1, 20117 each place it appears.
(b) AIR AMBULANCE.—Section 146(b)(1) of the Medi-
care Improvements for Patients and Providers Act of 2008

(Public Law 110-275), as amended by section 3105(b), is

15 further amended by striking “December 31, 2009, and dur-

16
17
18
19
20
21
22

g the period beginning on April 1, 2010, and ending on
January 1, 20117 and inserting “December 31, 2010”.

(c) SUPER RURAL AMBULANCE.—Section
1834(1)(12)(A) of the Social Security Act (42 U.S.C.
1395m(l)(12)(A)), as amended by section 3105(c), is further
amended by striking “2010, and on or after April 1, 2010,

and before January 1, 20117 and inserting “2011"".

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

|\ TN NG T NG T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e e T e T
LN A W D= O O NN NNl WD = O

2193
SEC. 10312. CERTAIN PAYMENT RULES FOR LONG-TERM

CARE HOSPITAL SERVICES AND MORATORIUM
ON THE ESTABLISHMENT OF CERTAIN HOS-
PITALS AND FACILITIES.

(a) CERTAIN PAYMENT RULES.—RSection 114(c) of the
Medicare, Medicaid, and SCHIP Extension Act of 2007 (42
U.S.C. 1395ww note), as amended by section 4302(a) of the
American Recovery and Reinvestment Act (Public Law
111-5) and section 3106(a) of this Act, s further amended
by striking “4-year period” each place it appears and in-
serting “5-year period”.

(b) MOrRATORIUM.—Section 114(d) of such Act (42
U.S.C. 1395uw note), as amended by section 3106(b) of this
Act, in the matter preceding subparagraph (A), is amended
by striking “4-year period” and inserting “5-year period”.
SEC. 10313. REVISIONS TO THE EXTENSION FOR THE RURAL

COMMUNITY HOSPITAL DEMONSTRATION
PROGRAM.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (g) of section 410A of
the Medicare Prescription Drug, Improvement, and Mod-
ernization Act of 2003 (Public Law 108-173; 117 Stat.
2272), as added by section 3123(a) of this Act, 1s amended
to read as follows:

“(g) FIVE-YEAR EXTENSION OF DEMONSTRATION PRO-

FRAM.—

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG N N T NG I NS R NS R e e T e T e T o T S O
[ B NG U N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

2194

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Subject to the succeeding
provisions of this subsection, the Secretary shall con-
duct the demonstration program under this section for
an additional 5-year period (in this section referred
to as the ‘5-year extension period’) that begins on the
date immediately following the last day of the initial
5-year period under subsection (a)(5).

“(2) EXPANSION OF DEMONSTRATION STATES.—
Notwithstanding subsection (a)(2), during the 5-year
extension period, the Secretary shall expand the num-
ber of States with low population densities deter-
mined by the Secretary under such subsection to 20.
In determining which States to include in such ex-
pansion, the Secretary shall use the same criteria and
data that the Secretary used to determine the States
under such subsection for purposes of the initial 5-
year period.

“(3) INCREASE IN MAXIMUM NUMBER OF HOS-
PITALS PARTICIPATING IN THE DEMONSTRATION PRO-
GRAM.—Notwithstanding subsection (a)(4), during the
S5-year extension period, not more than 30 rural com-
munity hospitals may participate in the demonstra-
tion program wunder this section.

“(4) HOSPITALS IN DEMONSTRATION PROGRAM

ON DATE OF ENACTMENT.—In the case of a rural

HR 3590 EAS/PP



2195

community hospital that is participating in the dem-
onstration program under this section as of the last

day of the inatial 5-year period, the Secretary—

O o0 9 N U B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

“(A) shall provide for the continued partici-
pation of such rural community hospital in the
demonstration program during the 5-year exten-
ston period unless the rural community hospital
makes an election, in such form and manner as
the Secretary may specify, to discontinue such
participation; and

“(B) i calculating the amount of payment
under subsection (b) to the rural community hos-
pital for covered impatient hospital services fur-
nished by the hospital during such 5-year exten-
sion period, shall substitute, under paragraph
(1)(A) of such subsection—

“(1) the reasonable costs of providing
such services for discharges occurring in the
first cost reporting period beginning on or
after the first day of the 5-year extension
period, for

“(11) the reasonable costs of providing
such services for discharges occurring in the

first cost reporting period beginning on or

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG I N T NS I NS I N R N e T e e T e T e T e T
[ B NG O N N = = NN - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O T NO S e

2196

after the implementation of the demonstra-
tion program.”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Subsection (a)(5) of
section 4104 of the Medicare Prescription Drug, Improve-
ment, and Modernization Act of 2003 (Public Law 108-
173; 117 Stat. 2272), as amended by section 3123(b) of this
Act, 1s amended by striking “1-year extension” and insert-
g “5-year extension”

SEC. 10314. ADJUSTMENT TO LOW-VOLUME HOSPITAL PRO-
VISION.

Section 1886(d)(12) of the Social Security Act (42
US.C. 1395ww(d)(12), as amended by section 3125, is
amended—

(1) wn subparagraph (C)(i), by striking “1,500
discharges” and inserting “1,600 discharges”; and
(2) in subparagraph (D), by striking “1,500 dis-
charges” and inserting “1,600 discharges”.
SEC. 10315. REVISIONS TO HOME HEALTH CARE PROVI-
SIONS.

(a) REBASING.—Section 1895(b)(3)(A)(1i1) of the So-

cial Security Act, as added by section 3131, 1s amended—
(1) in the clause heading, by striking “2013” and

wmserting “2014”;

(2) in subclause (1), by striking “2013” and in-

serting “2014”; and

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O o0 9 N U B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

2197
(3) in subclause (I1), by striking “2016” and in-

serting “2017”.

(b) REVISION OF HOME HEALTH STUDY AND RE-
PORT.—Section 3131(d) is amended to read as follows:

“(d) STUDY AND REPORT ON THE DEVELOPMENT OF
HoME HEALTH PAYMENT REVISIONS IN ORDER TO EN-
SURE ACCESS TO CARE AND PAYMENT FOR SEVERITY OF
ILLNESS.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of Health and

Human Services (in this section referred to as the

‘Secretary’) shall conduct a study on home health

agency costs involved with providing ongoing access

to care to low-income Medicare beneficiaries or bene-

Jiciaries in medically underserved areas, and in treat-

g beneficiaries with varying levels of severity of ill-

ness. In conducting the study, the Secretary may ana-

lyze items such as the following:

“(A) Methods to potentially revise the home
health prospective payment system under section
1895 of the Social Security Act (42 U.S.C.
13951ff) to account for costs related to patient se-
verity of illness or to improving beneficiary ac-

cess to care, such as—

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 3 O WD b W N e

|\ I O R NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e T e e e T
AW N = O 0O 0NN N B WNDd = O

2198

“(1) payment adjustments for services
that may mvolve additional or fewer re-
sources;

“(11) changes to reflect resources in-
volved with providing home health services
to low-income Medicare beneficiaries or
Medicare beneficiaries residing in medically
underserved areas;

“(111) ways outlier payments might be
revised to reflect costs of treating Medicare
beneficiaries with high levels of severity of
wllness; and

“(iw) other issues determined appro-
priate by the Secretary.

“(B) Operational issues involved with po-

tential vmplementation of potential revisions to
the home health payment system, including vm-
pacts for both home health agencies and adminis-
tratiwe and systems issues for the Centers for
Medicare & Medicaid Services, and any possible
payment vulnerabilities associated with imple-

menting potential revisions.

“(C) Whether additional research might be

needed.

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 2 O WD A W N e

| \O JEE \© R \O R \O N O R e e e e T e T e e e e
A W N = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

2199
“(D) Other items determined appropriate

by the Secretary.

“(2) CONSIDERATIONS.—In conducting the study
under paragraph (1), the Secretary may consider
whether patient severity of illness and access to care
could be measured by factors, such as—

“(A) population density and relative pa-
tient access to care;

“(B) wvariations in service costs for pro-
viding care to indwiduals who arve dually eligi-
ble under the Medicare and Medicaid programs;

“(C) the presence of severe or chronic dis-
eases, which might be measured by multiple, dis-
continuous home health episodes;

“(D) poverty status, such as evidenced by
the receipt of Supplemental Security Income
under title XVI of the Social Security Act; and

“(E) other factors determined appropriate
by the Secretary.

“(3) REPORT—Not later than March 1, 2014,
the Secretary shall submit to Congress a report on the
study conducted under paragraph (1), together with
recommendations for such legislation and administra-

tive action as the Secretary determines appropriate.

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

| \O JEE \© R \© R O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

2200

“(4) CONSULTATIONS.—In conducting the study
under paragraph (1), the Secretary shall consult with
appropriate stakeholders, such as groups representing
home health agencies and groups representing Medi-
care beneficiaries.

“(5)  MEDICARE  DEMONSTRATION  PROJECT
BASED ON THE RESULTS OF THE STUDY.—

“(A) IN GENERAL—Subject to subpara-
graph (D), taking into account the results of the
study conducted under paragraph (1), the Sec-
retary may, as determined appropriate, provide
Jor a demonstration project to test whether mak-
mg payment adjustments for home health serv-
wces under the Medicare program would substan-
twally 1mprove access to care for patients with
high severity levels of illness or for low-income or
underserved Medicare beneficiaries.

“(B) WAIVING BUDGET NEUTRALITY.—The
Secretary shall not reduce the standard prospec-
tive payment amount (or amounts) under section
1895 of the Social Security Act (42 U.S.C.
139511f) applicable to home health services fur-
nished during a period to offset any increase in

payments during such period resulting from the

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O© 00 2 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T N N N N = = N Re - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O T NO I e

2201

application of the payment adjustments under
subparagraph (A).

“(C) NO EFFECT ON SUBSEQUENT PERI-
0ODS.—A payment adjustment resulting from the
application of subparagraph (A) for a period—

“(1) shall not apply to payments for
home health services under title XVIII after
such period; and

“(11) shall not be taken into account in
calculating the payment amounts applicable

Jor such services after such period.

“(D) DURATION.—If the Secretary deter-

mines 1t appropriate to conduct the demonstra-
tion project under this subsection, the Secretary
shall conduct the project for a four year period
beginning not later than January 1, 2015.

“(E) FUNDING.—The Secretary shall pro-
vide for the transfer from the Federal Hospital
Insurance Trust Fund under section 1817 of the
Social Security Act (42 U.S.C. 13951) and the
Federal Supplementary Medical Insurance Trust
Fund established under section 1841 of such Act
(42 U.S.C. 1395t), in such proportion as the Sec-
retary determines appropriate, of $500,000,000

Jor the period of fiscal years 2015 through 2018.

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O o0 N N B W =

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
AW N = O O 0N N N Bl WNDd = O

2202

Such funds shall be made available for the study
described in paragraph (1) and the design, 1m-
plementation and evaluation of the demonstra-
tion described in this paragraph. Amounts avail-
able under this subparagraph shall be available
until expended.

“(F) EVALUATION AND REPORT.—If the
Secretary determines it appropriate to conduct
the demonstration project under this subsection,
the Secretary shall—

“(1) provide for an evaluation of the
project; and

“(1n) submit to Congress, by a date
specified by the Secretary, a report on the
project.

“(G) ADMINISTRATION.—Chapter 35 of title
44, United States Code, shall not apply with re-
spect to this subsection.”.

SEC. 10316. MEDICARE DSH.
Section 1886(r)(2)(B) of the Social Security Act, as
added by section 3133, 1s amended—
(1) in clause (1)—

(A) wn the matter preceding subclause (1),

by striking “(divided by 100);

HR 3590 EAS/PP



O o0 N N B W=

e T S S e e S e e T = O~ O =)
O o0 N O »n B~ W NN = O

20
21
22
23
24
25

2203
(B) in subclause (I), by striking “20127
and inserting “2013”;
(C) wn subclause (I1), by striking the period
at the end and inserting a comma; and
(D) by adding at the end the following flush
matter:
“minus 1.5 percentage points.”.
(2) in clause (11)—
(A) wn the matter preceding subclause (1),
by striking “(divided by 100)”;
(B) in subclause (1), by striking 2012”7
and inserting “2013;
(C) i subclause (11), by striking the period
at the end and inserting a comma; and
(D) by adding at the end the following flush
matter:
“and, for each of 2018 and 2019, minus 1.5
percentage points.”.
SEC. 10317. REVISIONS TO EXTENSION OF SECTION 508
HOSPITAL PROVISIONS.
Section 3137(a) 1s amended to read as follows:
“(a) EXTENSION.—